



**SUPPLEMENTAL INSTRUCTIONS**

Prices quoted must remain firm for a 30 day period after the opening date.

Freight terms: F.O.B. destination freight prepaid. All freight charges must be included in pricing submitted on proposal and not entered as separate pricing.

Any discount allowed by Vendor for prompt payment, etc. must be reflected in quoted figure, and not entered as separate pricing.

The City reserves the right to accept or reject any and all quotes.

 Sales Representative  
SIGNATURE AND TITLE

Tony DiIorio Sales representative  
TYPED OR PRINTED NAME AND TITLE

tonydiiorio@ceavco.com  
EMAIL

CEAVCO Audio Visual 303-539-3412/303-539-3401  
COMPANY NAME (AREA CODE) TELEPHONE & FAX NUMBER

6240 W 54th AVE Arvada, CO 80002 4/20/07  
ADDRESS: STREET, CITY, STATE, ZIP DATE

**PLEASE GO TO [www.fcgov.com/purchasing](http://www.fcgov.com/purchasing) TO REGISTER IN OUR E-PROCUREMENT SYSTEM FOR FUTURE BID OPPORTUNITIES! BE SURE TO SELECT ALL APPROPRIATE COMMODITY CODES!**

**FaxBid #6051 Portable  
Video Equipment for  
Public Access Bid Sheet**

QTY	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT #	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED	LEAD TIME
2	Panasonic AG-DVX100B camcorders	Panasonic #AG-DVX100B	\$3,675. <sup>00</sup>	\$7,350. <sup>00</sup>	2 weeks ARO
1	Petrol PCUB-1N U-Bag 1N Camcorder Bag	Petrol PCUB-1N			
2	Panasonic CGR-D54 Lithium-Ion Battery Pack  CGAD54SE/1B	Panasonic CGR-D54	\$147. <sup>00</sup>	\$294. <sup>00</sup>	2 weeks ARO
2	Tiffin 72mm UV Protector Glass Filter  72 UVP	Tiffin 72mm	\$13. <sup>00</sup>	\$26. <sup>00</sup>	2 weeks ARO
1	Century VS-06WA-DVX 0.6X Wide Angle Adapter Lens	Century VS-06WA-DVX	NO BID	NO BID	
2	Bogen 3001 N Tripods with 3433 (501) Fluid Heads  SDI, 3001BWN	Bogen 3001 N	\$325. <sup>00</sup>	\$650. <sup>00</sup>	2 weeks ARO
2	Panasonic PV-GS180 3-CCD camcorders	Panasonic PV-GS180	NO BID	NO BID	
1	Light Kit with Lowepro Edit 110 case and Sunpak 7001DX tripod	Light Kit	NO BID	NO BID	

**FaxBid #6051 Portable  
Video Equipment for  
Public Access Bid Sheet**

QTY	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT #	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED	LEAD TIME
1	Lowel Omni 3 Tungsten Light Kit (0193LBZ) with soft case  01-93LBZ	Lowel Omni 3 Tungsten Light Kit (0193LBZ)	\$1,215.00	\$ 1,215.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
1	Botero Super Collapsible Background - 8x16' - #026 Chroma-Key Green, with stands	Botero Super Collapsible Background - 8x16'	NO BID	NO BID	✓
2	Sony ECM 44B Lavalier Microphones	Sony ECM 44B	\$ 175.00	\$ 350.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
2	Azden 100LT UHF Wireless Lavalier Microphones	Azden 100LT	\$ 305.00	\$ 610.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
1	Sennheiser ME66/K6 - Shotgun Condenser Microphone with Universal Shock Mount, Rycote Softie, K-Tek Boompole, Universal Hand Grip, Right Angled XLR Cables	Sennheiser ME66/K6	\$ 456.00	\$ 456.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
6	25-foot XLR/M-XLR/F audio cables	XLRP-XLRJ-25EXF	\$ 18.00	\$ 108.00	2 weeks ARO ✓

**FaxBid #6051 Portable  
Video Equipment for  
Public Access Bid Sheet**

QTY	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT #	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED	LEAD TIME
4	50-foot XLR/M-XLR/F audio cables	XLRP-XLRJ-SDEXP	\$ 25.00	\$ 100.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
4	6-foot Mini Male to XLR Female cables	TA3P-TA3J-6	\$ 22.00	\$ 88.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
4	10 foot BNC/F-RCA/M video cables		NO BID	NO BID	✓
3	LaCie External USB 2.0 Hard Drive, 320GB, 7200 RPM (Item #219546)	LaCie External USB 2.0 Hard Drive	NO BID	NO BID	✓
1	Panasonic AG-DV2500 Professional DV Editing VTR	Panasonic AG-DV2500	\$ 1,1667.00	\$ 1,1667.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
50	MiniDV tapes in bulk	DUM 60	\$ 8.00	\$ 400.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
1	Shure SM57 Audio Microphone	Shure SM57 SM57-LL	\$ 97.00	\$ 97.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
1	Audio Technica Pro 37R Condenser Microphone	Audio Technica Pro 37R	\$ 128.00	\$ 128.00	2 weeks ARO ✓
2	Portable boom microphone stands		NO BID	NO BID	✓

FaxBid #6051 Portable Video Equipment for Public Access Bid Sheet					
QTY	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT #	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED	LEAD TIME
<b>TOTAL BID EXTENDED PRICE (IF ALL ITEMS BID):</b>				\$ 13,539. <sup>00</sup>	2 weeks ARO