

7.0 BID PROPOSAL

Bid # 5788, Lo-Bed Equipment Trailer

7.1 UNIT DESCRIPTION

(Tandem) Make - <i>Towmaster</i>	Model - <i>T-10 DP</i>	Year - <i>2003</i>
(Triple) Make - <i>No Bid</i>	Model - <i>No Bid</i>	Year - <i>No Bid</i>

7.2

BASE PRICE, Tandem Axle Trailer, as specified, per unit	\$ <i>5857.00</i>
BASE PRICE, Triple Axle Trailer, as specified, per unit	\$ <i>No Bid</i>

8.0 FREIGHT TERMS

FOB destination, freight prepaid. All freight charges must be included in bid pricing.

9.0 DELIVERY

Delivery will occur 30 days after proper notification of bid award.

10.0 CONTRACTOR'S STATEMENT

I have read and fully understand all the conditions, specifications, and special instructions herein set forth above in paragraphs 1.0 through 9.0. I hereby agree to comply with all said conditions, special instructions, and specifications as stated or implied.

Signature: <i>William R. Hess</i>	Title: <i>Territory Sales Manager</i>
Print Name: <i>William R. Hess</i>	
Company: <i>Ellen Equipment</i>	Date: <i>5/14/03</i>
Street: <i>3555 S. Lincoln Ave</i>	Phone #: <i>(970) 461-4960 Ex 110</i>
City/State/Zip: <i>Loveland, Co. 80537</i>	Fax #: <i>(970) 593-1169</i>

700
05

Bid # 5788

6.0-SPECIFICATIONS

6.1 Equipment bid on this proposal must meet or exceed the following minimum requirements.

LOW BED EQUIPMENT TRAILERS

General: This specification describes two-axle and three-axle low bed to be used for transporting equipment. All specifications are to be considered as a minimum, and all bids equivalent or exceeding these specifications will be considered. A complete and up-to-date manufacturer's specification must accompany bid. Any exceptions must be noted and listed in the space provided.

No.	Item	Description	Meets Spec?
6.2	QUANTITY:	One (1) – five (5)	
6.3	FRAME & DRAW BAR:	- High tensile steel heavy duty frame. - Cold-formed draw bar with four position pintle eye adjustment from ~ 16" to 25".	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.4	TIRE SIZE:	Low Profile tires, radials, ST205 - 75R15 LR-C. <i>225-75R15</i>	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.5	WHEELS & SPARE TIRE:	Steel wheels painted black. → <i>White Modular</i> Spare tire & wheel with mount, installed.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.6	AXLES & SUSPENSION:	- minimum 3,500 lb. GAWR each axle, with Dexter Torflex or approved equivalent suspension. <i>6000 lb</i>	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.7	BRAKES:	- Heavy-duty electric brakes for each wheel. - Brake size approximately: 10 X 2, - Self-adjusting. - Integral Break-A-Way System with wet cell battery.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.8	OIL SEALS:	Grease	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.9	SAFETY CHAINS:	Two chains, with hooks	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.10	PARKING JACK:	5,000 lbs. capacity with spring latch drop down leg. <i>7,000 lb</i>	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.11	LIGHTS:	12 volt approved, sealed beam, rubber mounted with wiring harness in conduit.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.12	TRAILER PLUG:	Six-way electrical plug, Standard TCP-61M or approved equivalent	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.13	JUNCTION BOX:	Electric with circuit breakers for easy maintenance.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.14	DECKING:	3/16" steel diamond plate welded to frame and cross members.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No

ENT ()
ICC
305

Bid # 5788
Lo-bed Equipment Trailer

6.15	RAMPS:	60" flip-up ramps with torsion spring-assist. Ramps must have the same overall width as the trailer deck.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.16	TIE DOWNS:	¾" forged D-rings, one front center, four each side with one at each corner and one on either side of fenders.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.17	OVERALL LENGTH:	- Tandem axle trailer ~ 21', A-frame plus deck length - Triple axle trailer ~ 29' N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.18	OVERALL WIDTH:	~ 102"	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.19	DECK LENGTH:	- Tandem axle trailer - 16' flat deck - Triple axle trailer ~ 24' flat deck N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.20	DECK WIDTH:	82-83" minimum	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.21	DECK HEIGHT:	~ 14" to 16" 2 1/2"	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.22	CAPACITY:	- Tandem axle trailer ~ 8,200 GVWR - Triple axle trailer ~ 12,000 GVWR N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.23	LOAD CAPACITY:	- Tandem axle trailer ~ 6,500 lb. - Triple axle trailer ~ 9,000 lb. N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.24	COLOR:	Dark Green	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.25	TOOL BOX:	Built into A-frame, with lockable lid.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No
6.26	GVW CERT. AND MSO:	Must be furnished upon delivery.	yes
6.27	MANUALS:	Provide any available parts and service manuals	yes
6.28	FOB POINT:	Delivery of completed unit shall be made to the Equipment Services Facility, 835 Wood Street, Fort Collins, CO.	
6.29	WARRANTY:	Full 1-year warranty commencing from date of delivery. Warranty shall cover defective components and workmanship, and coverage shall include parts and labor associated with any defects.	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No

Exceptions from the above specifications, if any:

Tire Standard Size 225-75R15 / wheels are steel
White Modular / Deck height 2 1/2'

Any questions regarding this inquiry should be directed to Jim Hume, 970-221-6776.

INTL
'00
005



We're not No. 1. You are!

ELLEN EQUIPMENT CORPORATION

**City of Fort Collins
Purchasing Office
215 North Mason Street
Fort Collins, Co. 80524**

James B. O'Neill II,

All of us at Ellen Equipment would like to thank you and everyone involved at the City for the opportunity to participate in this bid process.

May we fulfill your needs now and in the future with the professionalism that is expected by you, the City of Fort Collins, all of our customers and ourselves.

William R. Hess
Territory Sales Manager

*Bid # 5788
Lo-bed Equipment Trailer*

18000 East 22nd Avenue
Aurora, CO 80011
(303) 364-1888
Fax 340-4327

6613 Edith Blvd. NE
Albuquerque, NM 87113
(505) 342-2566
Fax 849-1699

5105 East Highway 24
Colorado Springs, CO 80915
(719) 596-2924
Fax 596-2799

410 South Cotton Street
El Paso, TX 79901
(915) 532-6931
Fax 532-3371

901 South West Frontage Rd.
Ft. Collins, CO 80524
(970) 484-4960
Fax 221-0686